
To: 
From: J 
Sent: Tue 10/9/2018 9:49:27 PM 
Subject: Re: 

ok 

On Tue, Oct 9, 2018 at 5:47 PM wrote: 

unfortunately I could not get on a flight to NY with that would work nicely 
for her on to Vilnius. It would have been 2 more flights and we would not be able to use the 
money on the ticket she is holding due to the flights were on a different airline. I kept the 
Miami-Paris-Vilnius for departing Miami around 7:30pm... will take a 
3:10pm flight from West Palm...  either 3:10pm or 1:04pm ...) Once I have the tickets, 
I will forward. We still haves return portion to use for her when she returns to Paris 
minus the change fee plus any fare difference. 

On Oct 9, 2018, at 4:24 PM, J <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

lets send home friday . to new york 
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