
To: Bella Klein 
Cc: 
From: 
Sent Mon 1/28/2019 9:47:16 PM 
Subject.• Re: davos accomodation 

Rich received the invoice for accommodation. We also purchased a round trip flight to Zurich for 
Joscha. 
I am not sure what entity is paying. 

On Jan 28, 2019, at 4:36 PM, Bella Klein wrote: 

Did we received invoice for accommodation or enhanced is paying for travel only, please 
advise 

Thank you, 
Bella 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
Subject: Re: davos accomodation 
Date: January 21, 2019 at 10:01.55 AM EST 
To: Joscha Bach 

, Bella Klein 

Thank you. I will pass on to our accounting dept. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Jan 20, 2019, at 2:12 PM, Joscha Bach wrote: 

Joscha 

Dea 
Here is t e invoice for the accommodation! 
Bests, and thank you, 

Begin forwarded message: 
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From: Vivian Son 

Subject: Re: davos accomodation 
Date: January 20, 2019 at 12:08:11 
EST 
To: Joscha Bach 

Cc: yanling duan 
, Andrea 

Herrera 

HI Joscha, 
Please see the invoice attached, the address is on the invoice. 
Please contact @ Andrea for key collection. 
Safe travels, see you soon. 
vivian 

On Fri, Jan 18, 2019 at 7:51 PM Joscha Bach 
ote: 

My contact number is 
Please get in touch wrt the address, so we can find our way there. 

> On Jan 18, 2019, at 06:47, yanling duan 
wrote: 

> Very much appreciate sending me your whatsup to share info my 
colleague Andes, blockbase home host will 
take it from here. 

> Vivian will send you the invoice info and attached images of the 
chalet 

> Sent from my iPhone 

>> On Jan 18, 2019, at 7:06 AM, Joscha Bach 
wrote: 

>> 

>> Dear Yanling, if you meant to include information about the chalet 
with your previous email, it is missing :) 

>> There was no attachment. 

EFTA_R1_01086984 

EFTA02274034



>> 
>>> On Jan 17, 2019, at 09:02, yanling duan 

wrote: 
>» 
>>> hi, joshcha: this is our chalet information. 
>>> 

>>> i think gino will be around, but please confirm with him? 
>» 
>>> we are staying kioster and just to make sure how many of you and 

i am sending you invoice. thank you. 
>» 
>» 
>» 
>» 
>» 
>>>> On Jan 16, 2019, at 7:50 PM, Joscha Bach 

wrote: 
>>» 
>>>> Dear Yanling, I assume this is the place that we share with Gino 

et al? 
>>>> Could you please send us payment information and the address 

of the accommodation in Davos, as well as 
a way to reach you by phone in an 
emergency (i.e. when one of us is getting 
lost)? 

>>» 
>>>> Dear Lesley, could you please organize the payment for Svetlana 

and myself? 
>>» 
>>>> Bests and thank you! 
>>» 
>>>> Joscha 
>>» 
>>» 
>>» 
>>» 
>>» 
>>>>> On Jan 16, 2019, at 10:44, yanling duan 

a wrote: 
>>>» 
>>>>> bi, joscha: 
>>>» 
>>>>> welcome to share with blockbase team, 3500FRC/person for 

the week. we have few spaces left. please 
let me asap. 
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>> 

> 

<Klosters Housing_Guanxi Joscha.pdf> 
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