
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent: Wednesday, February 4, 2015 10:06 PM 
To: Karyna Shuliak 
Cc: bellaklein 
Subject: JSC Payroll 

jeffrey mentioned that he will begin payroll march 1st from =SC interiors annual salary will be 50,000 which =ill be paid 
every 2 weeks gross paycheck before =axes and withholding = 50,000 / 26 = 1,923.07 i =ill send you some forms in next 
email to complete please call me or bella with any questions thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington =venue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: =/b>Karyna Shuliak 

Date: =/b>February 3, 2015 at 3:55:28 PM =ST 

Subject: =/b>Karyna green =ard 

To: =/b>Richard Kahn 
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