
From: 
Sent: , 2012 5:43 PM 
To: 
Subject: Re: radiator cover 

> 

Hi Fabian, 
My building manager from OSSA Properties (Anthony Barrett)sent you a check for the deposit for the 2 radiator covers 
for my new apt. 
Can you please confirm you received it? Thanks! 

On Oct 19, 2012, at 8:13 PM wrote: 

Hi MI. 
I would like to know if you are going to do the radiator cover for your apartment, I'm doing my schedules for the 

next weeks. 
Tks. 
Best Regards 
Fabian 
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