From: Richard Kahn <[ -

Sent: Wednesday, October 22, 2014 5:11 PM

To: jeffrey E.

Subject: Fwd: Erin Invoice October

Attachments: 66TH STREET OCTOBER UPDATES INVOICE.xlsx; Untitled attachment 00281.htm

Attached is invoice frt:lrn- for Karyna apartment =n the amount of 4,711.59 Karyna has verified accuracy and is =aiting
on 1 piece No backup was attached for =erification

Please advise if i should request =ackup or pay Thank you

Richard Kahn

HBRE Associates =nc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

tel

fax
cell

Begin forwarded message:

From: Karyna Shuliak -:_:-::r:-

Subject: HE:- =nvoice October

Date: October 21, 2014 at 5:03:02 PM EDT

To: Richard Kahn </

Hi Rich,
It is correct, =xcept the round entry mirror has not been delivered =et,
Thank you!

Sent from my iPhone

On =ct 21, 2014, at 4:54 PM, Richard Kahn <[ NN =" te:

can you please review =ttached invoice for accuracy
thank you

Richard Kahn

HBRE Associates =nc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
Mew York, NY 10022

EFTA_R1_01347158
EFTA02359138



fax [
cell

<f=iv=

Begin forwarded message:

Date: =/b>0ctober 20, 2014 at =0:38:57 AM EDT

Tos /b>Richard Kah <

Hella Rich

- sent me this =nvoice
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