From: Ann Rodriquez _

Sent: Wednesday, July 13, 2016 3:13 PM
To: jeffrey E.
Subject: Re: Pokey: Bid for Staff Bath

Up by the existing shed because it has septic and plumbing already setup up

Ann R.

On Jul 13, 2016, at 11:03 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> > wrote:

where

On Wed, Jul 13, 2016 at 10:33 AM, Ann Rodriquez _
I, i ote:

Hey Bossman,

Pokey's Bid to do the staff bath on GS/ just like the staff bath on LSJ is $15,000.00

Please advise,
Ann R.

please note
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